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FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT

| am responding to your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act.
The answers to your specific questions are as follows:

The numbers of people 18-65 plus years with whom your Trust has/had contact
with, with the following diagnostic codes irrespective of where they are situated
within the spectrum of individuals codes.

Q1

Could you please provide the data for the period between Jan 1st 2019 and
March 31st 2024. The 1C1 codes are from the ICD11 - if you have not yet
implemented it, please state so.

a)
b)
c)
d)
e)
f)

9)
h)
i)

i)

A69.2
A69.9
6D85.Y
9B66.1
8A45.0Y
1C1G.Z2
1C1G.1
1C1G.12
1C1G.Y
1C1G.0
1C1G.1Z
1C1G.13
1C1G.10
1C1G.1Y
1C1G14

32

6
We do not hold this information as we do not use this code.
We do not hold this information as we do not use this code.
We do not hold this information as we do not use this code.
We do not hold this information as we do not use this code.
We do not hold this information as we do not use this code.
We do not hold this information as we do not use this code.
We do not hold this information as we do not use this code.
We do not hold this information as we do not use this code.
We do not hold this information as we do not use this code.
We do not hold this information as we do not use this code.
We do not hold this information as we do not use this code.
We do not hold this information as we do not use this code.
We do not hold this information as we do not use this code.

Please note the following:

There are 7 patients that were admitted more than once during this time
period with the diagnostic code of AG92.
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Q2 Could
codes

a)
b)
c)
d)
e)
f)

g)
h)

you please provide the numbers of people 0-18 with the following
between the same period?

A69.2
A69.9
G51
G58.7
G58.9
G03.9
MO6.4
L90.4

Please see the table below for the number of patients 0-18, diagnosed with one of
the above codes above for the period 15t January 2109 to 315t March 2024:

Diagnostic Amount of
code Patients

AG92
G039
G510
G518
G519
L904

5
10
32

1

2

1

Grand Total |51

Please note the following:

There were no patients from 0-18 years diagnosed with G58.7, G58.9 and
MOG6.4 during this time period.

There are 5 patients that have been admitted more than once with the
diagnostic code of G510 during this time period.

There is 1 patient that has been admitted more than once with the diagnostic
code of A692 during this time period.

If I can be of any further assistance, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Should you be dissatisfied with the Trust’s response to your request, you have the right to

request an in

ternal review. Please write to the Freedom of Information Department (esh-

tr.foi@nhs.net), quoting the above reference, within 40 working days. The Trust is not

obliged to accept an internal review after this date.
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Should you still be dissatisfied with your FOI request, you have the right of complaint to the
Information Commissioner at the following address:

The Information Commissioner’s Office
Woycliffe House

Water Lane

Wilmslow

Cheshire  SK9 5AF

Telephone: 0303 123 1113

Yours sincerely

Freedom of Information Department
esh-tr.foi@nhs.net
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