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FREEDOM OF INFORMATION ACT

| am responding to your request for information under the Freedom of Information Act.
The answers to your specific questions are as follows:

Please provide information for your Bank workforce for FY 2024/25 (or the most
recent 12 months):

1. Do you outsource payroll for Bank workers? If yes, name of provider.
Yes, NHS Shared Business Services (also see Q2).

2. Your fee model for Bank payroll (e.g., per payslip, per hours processed, per
timesheet, % of gross pay).

East Sussex Healthcare NHS Trust does not hold a separate contract for our Bank
Payroll.

The Trust’s entire payroll service, including Bank Payroll, is delivered through an
outsourced collaborative contract with the Sussex Health & Care Partnership.

As this contract is not held as a standalone contract by our organisation, we do not
hold the specific information requested.

Please contact NHS Sussex who may be able to assist you with your request,
contact details as follows:

Email: sxicb.foi@nhs.net

3. The fee level actually paid (e.g., £ per payslip / £ per hour / £ per timesheet / %).

We do not hold this information, please refer to question 2.
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4. Average number of Bank payslips per pay period and pay frequency
(weekly/monthly).

We do not hold this information, please refer to question 2.

5. Any additional charges (off-cycle payments, corrections, pension retros, RTI
re-submissions).

We do not hold this information, please refer to question 2.

6. If Bank payroll is delivered in-house, please confirm your internal cost per
payslip (or best estimate) for Bank staff.

Please provide any available contract end dates.

We do not hold this information, please refer to question 2.
If I can be of any further assistance, please do not hesitate to contact me.
Should you be dissatisfied with the Trust’s response to your request, you have the right to
request an internal review. Please write to the Freedom of Information Department (esh-

tr.foi@nhs.net), quoting the above reference, within 40 working days. The Trust is not
obliged to accept an internal review after this date.

Should you still be dissatisfied with your FOI request, you have the right of complaint to the
Information Commissioner at the following address:

The Information Commissioner’s Office
Woycliffe House

Water Lane

Wilmslow

Cheshire  SK9 5AF

Telephone: 0303 123 1113

Yours sincerely

Freedom of Information Department
esh-tr.foi@nhs.net
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